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MEDIA RELEASE 

 

The DRC Minister of Mines, H.E. Mr Kizito Pakabomba, visits Metalkol SA, salutes 
the company’s commitment and contribution to a sustainable and inclusive 

development of the mining sector in the DRC   

On Saturday, 17 August 2024, Eurasian Resources Group in Africa (ERG Africa) had the 
honour of welcoming His Excellency (H.E), Mr Kizito Pakabomba, the National Minister 
of Mines of the Democratic Republic of Congo (DRC), to its Metalkol SA operation in the 
province of Lualaba for an official visit that marks the strengthening of a shared and 
promising vision for the sustainable development of the mining sector at national and 
international levels. 

As part of his tour of the Greater Katanga region, the Minister of Mines, H.E. Mr Kizito 
Pakabomba, accompanied by his delegation, visited the Metalkol SA mining site, a 
subsidiary of ERG Africa in which the DRC is also a shareholder. 

Metalkol SA is a major tailings reprocessing operation in the DRC mining sector, 
processing copper and cobalt tailings from the Kingamyambo dam and the Musonoi River 
valley. 

This visit, which follows an initial constructive meeting held in Kinshasa in mid-July with 
ERG Africa’s Chief Executive Officer (CEO), Nicolas Treand marks the continuation of a 
promising dialogue between the Ministry of Mines and ERG Africa aimed at promoting 
the sustainable and inclusive development of the mining sector in the DRC.  

After a warm welcome by the management and staff of Metalkol SA, the Minister of Mines 
and his delegation took part in a safety induction, followed by a visit of Metalkol SA’s 
operations, including the Musonoi site, and participated in a closed meeting discussion. 
During this visit, Mr Jean-Claude Lubembe, Metalkol SA’s Head of Operations, presented 
the hydromechanical mining and dredging technology used for the extraction of copper 
and cobalt, highlighting the innovative aspects and the efforts made to minimise the 
environmental impact and meet the standards of ethical and responsible production.  

This visit was an opportunity to deepen the exchange on the strategic challenges of the 
mining sector in the DRC. Particular attention was paid to ERG Africa’s commitment to 
being a responsible mining producer. Mr Emmanuel Henry, ERG Africa’s Deputy CEO, 
commented, “We are very pleased to welcome His Excellency the Minister of Mines to 
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our Metalkol SA site and, through his presence, we acknowledge his desire to support 
the mining sector. This is an opportunity for us to concretely demonstrate our commitment 
to sustainable and responsible development in the DRC, so that the discussions can be 
translated into concrete actions. We are determined to continue our efforts in this 
direction.”  

In his comments the Minister highlighted: “I would like to commend your efforts in the 
field of sustainable development as you have presented them. Metalkol is committed to 
meeting international environmental standards. This is essential in a world where climate 
challenges are becoming more pressing. The global energy transition depends on critical 
metals such as cobalt and copper, and your role in this strategic process is an important 
point not only for our country, but for the whole of humanity.”  

The exchange also highlighted ERG Africa’s key role in creating a sustainable ecosystem 
for the various stakeholders. His Excellency the Minister of Mines added: “I am delighted 
that you are contributing to the improvement of local employment and the living conditions 
of the surrounding communities, as well as the transfer of technology and skills for the 
benefit of the Congolese people. This is what we call true integrated and inclusive 
development as advocated by His Excellency the President of the Republic, Head of 
State.” 

This visit to Metalkol SA demonstrates the importance of ERG activities to the DRC 
government and to the challenges of energy transition at a global level. The Minister 
concluded his remarks by reaffirming the Congolese Government’s commitment to 
supporting initiatives that promote economic growth, environmental protection and the 
improvement of the living conditions of its citizens. “Together, the Ministry of Mines, the 
relevant government departments, Metalkol SA and ERG, can build a prosperous and 
sustainable future for the DRC.” 
 
 
For more information, please contact: 
Eurasian Resources Group Africa, Johannesburg 
Communications.Africa@ergafrica.com or press@erg.net 
www.ergafrica.com 
 

About Eurasian Resources Group:  

Eurasian Resources Group (ERG) is a leading diversified natural resources group 
headquartered in Luxembourg with integrated mining, processing, energy, logistics, and 
marketing operations. The Group operates in almost 20 countries and is a major 
employer in the industry with more than 80,000 employees and contractors.  

ERG is one of the world’s largest producers of cobalt and ferrochrome. It is also a large 
global supplier of copper and high-grade iron ore. In Eurasia, it is one of the major 
suppliers of alumina and is Kazakhstan’s only producer of high-grade aluminium. 

In Africa, ERG mines and processes copper and cobalt ore and produces copper metal 
and cobalt hydroxide. Frontier is the cornerstone of the Group’s copper business, and 
ERG’s Metalkol, a major tailings reprocessing operation in the Democratic Republic of 
Congo, has become one of the world’s largest producers of cobalt as well as a major 
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producer of copper. The Group has its own supply chain on the continent through its 
logistics company SABOT as well as development projects which are focused on other 
minerals and products across the African continent, including South Africa and 
Zimbabwe.  

ERG is a founding member of the Global Battery Alliance (GBA), hosted originally on the 
platform of the World Economic Forum. The GBA is dedicated to ensuring an ethical and 
sustainable global supply chain for the lithium-ion batteries that can power the Fourth 
Industrial Revolution and a low carbon economy through electric vehicles, renewable 
energy technologies and smartphones. Since its establishment in 2017, the GBA has 
grown to include more than 150 leading businesses and international organizations as 
members, becoming the world’s largest multi-stakeholder consortium in the energy 
storage space. In 2023, GBA has launched the world’s first Battery Passport. 

ERG champions the WEF Securing Minerals for the Energy Transition (SMET) initiative, 
which aims to secure a reliable supply of the critical minerals vital for decarbonisation. 


